
PETLOCK PURCHASES 
CENTER STREET BLOCK

Has Occupied Store Next to 
The Railroad Track* For 

20 Year*

Morris Petlock, proprietor ot 
the Cut Price Market at 90 Cen­
ter street, has purchased the 
property in which he has been 
located for many years from the 
heirs of Lewis B. Swett in a real 
estate deal Just completed.

Mr. Petlock plans to make ex­
tensive alterations and remodel­
ling and during the short time 
that will be required for this 
work the store will be closed.

This property is bounded on 
the north by Center street; on 
the west by the Maine Central 
railroad; on the south by land of 
the heirs of Andrew Tarbox and 
on the cast by the brick building 
occupied by the Excel Cleaners, 
and other property on Washing­
ton street..

Mr. Petlock has occupied this 
site and operated a meat market 
and grocery store there for the 
last 20 years. When alterations 
are completed the store will be 
equipped with every facility to 
give his customers the best of 
service and lie will continue to 
carry the fine line of meats and 
products that have featured this 
store since it opened nearly 20 
years ago.


